3/19/2019 Yahoo Mail - RE: Proposal for the Florence Douglas Center

RE: Proposal for the Florence Douglas Center

From: |_E_C@yahoo.com
To: marc4ucb@yahoo.com

Date: Tuesday, March 19, 2019, 10:48 AM PDT

Hello Marc,

The prices | have from my suppliers can’t be guaranteed for usually more than 6 months since they are subject to
available supply and any active promotional offers at the time of purchase, so I'll need a signed contract as soon as
possible with a down payment for the entire lighting package by June at the latest for the price of $25.5k to remain valid.
Afterwards, I'll need to re-submit a bid with numbers, lighting types, or both adjusted.

As of now, this is the breakdown of prices:

-104ct of LED 4ft tandem surface mount fixtures: $9,360
-41ct of LED 2x4 drop-in troffers: $4,920

-8ct LED emergency/exit combo fixtures: $560

-25ct LED PAR3O0 flood lamps: $275

-scissor lift rental for approx. 1 week: $1,100

-labor: $9,285

Please let me know what else you require from me.

Thanks,

Shaun Mason
INDEPENDENT ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION
#Lic. 1015674

From: Marc Buchalter

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 11:46 AM

To: i_e_c@yahoo.com; Jeff Hall

Subject: Proposal for the Florence Douglas Center

Can you please send me a break out of the labor cost for you proposal wich | have attached for your convenience.
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